
Kennywood’s: Biggest Holiday Lights Yet Features All-New Immersive RudolphTM Experience  
The USA Today 10Best Holiday Event will shine even brighter as the park hosts Rudolph the Red-Nosed Reindeer and his friends for 

meet & greets, plus new shows, more lights and even more nights this season  

 
PITTSBURGH, PA: August 5, 2024 – Join in the joy at Kennywood, Pittsburgh’s Home for the Holidays, this winter as the 
park introduces the largest expansion ever to its beloved annual event Holiday Lights, headlined by the addition of meet 
and greets with iconic characters from the classic TV special, Rudolph the Red-Nosed Reindeer. Beginning Friday, 
November 15, Kennywood will shine brighter as guests have the chance to meet Rudolph, Bumble, Clarice and Sam the 
Snowman during the park’s most immersive holiday experience to date.  
 
The USA Today 10Best Holiday Event will transport visitors to a winter wonderland filled with sparkling lights, decked 
halls and the iconic characters from this timeless Christmas classic, creating family memories that will be treasured 
forever. From meet and greets to photo opportunities, guests will shout with glee during a visit to the new home of 
Rudolph the Red-Nosed Reindeer. 
 
“This year’s Holiday Lights will showcase the largest investment the park has ever made in this beloved event in 13 
years, making Kennywood the perfect place to create cherished holiday memories this year,” said General Manager Rick 
Spicuzza. “Kennywood is welcoming Rudolph and friends for meet and greets for the first-time ever, adding new 
exhilarating festive entertainment, even more lights and extra days, offering more chances and reasons to join in the joy 
at Pittsburgh’s Home for the Holidays.”   
 
Kennywood’s annual holiday event has more dates than ever before, giving guests more opportunities to enjoy more 
than 20 holiday attractions, including a brand-new light show synchronized to classic holiday music with dancing 
illuminations across the lagoon. Holiday Lights will also feature new festive decorations throughout the park, more than 
three million twinkling lights, Pennsylvania’s tallest Christmas tree, visits with Santa Claus and Kennywood’s classic and 
thrilling rides.  
 
Guests can make the season sparkle by taking advantage of the 2025 Season Pass Sale offering the best price of the 
season. Season Passes for next year are available right now with savings of up to $60 off, offering the remainder of 
Kennywood’s summer season, now including two more illuminating drone shows over the lagoon with extended park 
hours on August 24 and 25. 2025 Season Passes also provide free admission to Phantom Fall Fest and Holiday Lights, in 
addition to all of 2025 with tons of perks like free parking, bonus friend tickets and much more with select passes.  
 
For more information on the all-new Holiday Lights and to purchase Season Passes, visit Kennywood.com.  
 

### 
 
About Kennywood:  
Kennywood is Pittsburgh’s Destination for Family Fun and Entertainment. The Pittsburgh-area park, founded in 1898 
offers a unique mix of modern thrills and classic rides, including seven roller coasters, Kiddieland, and several attractions 
that cannot be found anywhere else.  
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